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Last Sunday Greg had a very good lesson on the Philip the evangelist and the Ethiopian Eunuch in Acts 8. He shared that 
we need to be more evangelisDc and to be more willing to share Jesus with others. Since most of the congregaDon did 
not hear my announcement or what I have been doing for the last 3 months I am going to share it right here. I have over 
700 students connected with World Bible School. Most of them have stopped doing their lessons. Some of them will 
start doing their lessons again in months or years down the road. It is our job to plant the seed and God’s gives the 
increase. One of my students Sarah Awuor just got bapDzed in April I will share in my last paragraph.  

Help Someone Study the Bible by being connected with World Bible School  

Hundreds of people register to study the Bible online each week and are ready for you to encourage them. As a study 
helper and seed sower of God’s Word, you will form a personal relaDonship with your student as you teach the Gospel. 
Not everyone who registers will do their lessons, but there are those who are sincere and want to know more about 
God’s word. This is an opportunity to share Jesus and Him crucified from your home. To become a teacher go to hTps://
www.worldbibleschool.net/ 

Help someone learn English by using the Bible by being connected with World English Ins;tute  

Some of you are teachers and are on Summer break, but the following is an opportunity for you to be more involved in 
sharing Jesus. You too can help students learn English and the Bible. You can use WEI to teach people about Christ locally 
and around the world. Unlike other Bible Correspondence Courses, WEI gathers students who are interested in learning 
the English language. The reading assignments are lessons from the Bible. You can chose students who take elementary, 
intermediate, or advanced lessons.  

In the intermediate lessons, students will discover God as their creator and get an overview of the Bible from Genesis 
through the book of Acts. The advanced lessons are for maturing Bible students. WEI’s Advanced English series is an in-
depth study of Listening, WriDng, & Vocabulary.  

You can sign up at: hTps://www.worldenglishinsDtute.net/ 

The lessons for the free English courses are at hTps://www.worldenglishinsDtute.org/ 

The third ministry I am involved in is helping the less fortunate. Sarah Awuor, one of my students, in Kenya, Africa is 20 
years old. She has 6 siblings younger than her. They are orphans and there are no orphanages in Migori, Nyanza, Kenya. 
The people who come to the House of Hope live like kings compared to these orphans and the small group that meets at 
the Church of Christ there. They were eaDng one meal or less a day. Sarah goes around to homes and other places to find 
jobs to do to earn money to feed her and her 6 siblings. They were wearing clothes that were falling apart. So I have 
started sending them money to help out (James 1:27). I am running out of space so I will finish my thoughts with Sarah 
Janet Adhiambo who is a widow, and Robinson Julius Okinyi the minister there.       

More on Sarah in my next arDcle.  
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